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Abstract 

Stylistic is a critic school that distinguished itself from other schools with 
the way it deals with literary texts from all aspects, as by penetrating the 
texts' deep structure, it was able to understand the secrets of the text 
and dived to its depths, and thus, stylistic was adopted as the way of 
conducting this study. And due to the fact that our literary heritage is 
inseparable part of our civilization and without it no future could be 
attained,  this study came to form a bridge between the past and the 
present as it conducted a modern criticism on an old book. 

Ali Bin Al-Jahm was an Abbasside poet who lived the eras of a number 
of Abbasside caliphs and witnessed a number of important events in his 
life. His poetry formed a historic humanitarian document due to the 
oppression he suffered, and his poetry depended on many phenomena 
that helped formed a distinguished stylistic features that carry indications 
beyond its lexicon meanings forcing this study to focus on the most 
distinguished ones in his divan, and showed that his poetry was indeed 
a garden with variety of trees and fruits, and thus, results came in 
harmony with this poetry. 

This study comprised an introduction and four chapters, in which, the 
first chapter handled the stylistic phenomena that were featured in his 
poetry and the lexicon guides and the deep structure of the meaning. 
Repetition came here as a vital feature that pointed out many indications 
as it indicated proudness. Anger, steadfastness and underscored the 
principles of the poet. The dialogue has also enriched the divan with 
narrative drama as it formed a narrative structure although it only 



 
 

comprised the narrator represented by the poet himself only. The place 
drew an intersection with time forming a fantastic rhythm where past and 
present embrace and created strong bond among them. 

The second chapter of this study was of two parts, the first dealt with 
the characteristics of departure in Ibn Al-Jahm poetry represented by 
metaphor , metonymy, and simile that took the poem out of dullness and 
fashion, and the second dealt with complex departure featured with 
separation, preceding, delaying carrying long-range indications. 

The third chapter, on the other hand, handled the beauty of quoting in 
his poetry whether religious of literary quoting as he used the religious 
quoting as a weapon of reply and determent being the true and most 
convincing, and thus, by quoting verses of the Quran he proved his 
truthfulness, and strengthen 
hesitate to employ sayings and literary personalities of different eras that 
preceded him, including the Umawite , the Islamic, and pre-Islamic eras 
to give himself a characteristic that no poet has ever obtained. 

Chapter four dealt with the poetry picture that formed an important pillar 
of the pillars of success in his poetry as he concentrated on presenting it 
in complex manner that revealed his relationship with the community he 
is living with and surrounding him. The picture in Ibn Jahm poetry was a 
beautiful and colorful one full of rhythm, harmony, and movement where 
he pictured out his Abbasside community and the lavish life they were 
living.      
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